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Vision 

Shine like stars 

Through God’s love, we will 

flourish and develop our gifts 

in our nurturing community, 

as we strive to be an 

inspiration to all.  

Your light must shine before people, 

so that they will see the good things 

you do and praise your Father in 

heaven.’ Matthew 5:16 

 

 

Key Strengths 

 Nurturing, supportive, 
ambitious and passionate 
staff team. 

 Strong teaching and learning 
across the school 

 *Vision statement being 
successfully embedded across 
the school 

 Proactive Leadership and Staff 
– drive for excellence 

 Maintaining strong 
outcomes/attainment and 
progress at the end of key 
stage 2 

 

Key Priorities for 24-25 

 To implement the reviewed 
collective worship and 
spirituality policy, strengthening 
the spiritual ethos of the school 

 To implement the reviewed two-
year curriculum, starting with 
Year A  

 Implementation of the new 
English, Science and Computing 
curriculum  

 To ensure that we are adapting 
our teaching in all subjects to 
support pupils’ independence, 
deepening their knowledge and 
understanding over time.  


